

We built Contraqer GovIntel to help government contractors plan strategically, manage opportunities, identify teaming partners, and win more. Contraqer features modules like Opportunity Search, Profiles and Teaming (coming early 2022). Government contractors can subscribe to one, all, or any that fit their business.

Opportunity Search - Find and import your opportunities

Prioritizing all active solicitations to find opportunities in your wheelhouse, then importing data into your CRM or capture systems is tedious and error prone. Even finding a mod you are looking for can be challenging. With Contrager, you can:

- Automatically import all solicitations with their attachments from any source you can access as a prime or sub
- Use scoring and keyword search to find what you're looking for
- Assign solicitations to capture teams
- Forward solicitations with attachments to your partners

Sales and capture teams quickly identify more of the opportunities they're looking for, then save significant time automatically importing information and engaging resources to win the business.

- → C	dev.	.contrager.	com/ReviewImpo	ortedRFQs							Q \$	Ma 🖚 🕑 🤇	Update :	
Contrager	-internal 📙	HR 📙	Government contra	📙 VARs	lntegrators	📙 MRO 📃 Eve	ents 📙 Cor	mp Int	tel / Resear 📙	Personal 🏷	HubSpot Login	» 🗄	Reading list	
CONTRA		Dashboard	✓ Intelligence ✓	Sales → Refer	ence Data 🗸 🛛 Rep	orts 🗸 Utilities 🗸	Admin 🗸						SK -	
🗟 🕨 Home														
	R			DRFOs										
			tal Imported RFQs								Send AdHoc	RFQ		
		hicle(s)	Agency(-ies)		gency(-ies)	Owner(s)	Team(s)		User(s)	Partn				
	Se	elect Vehicle(s)	Select Agen	cy(-ies) Sele	ct Sub-Agency(-ies)	Select Owner(s)	Assigned By	m(s)	Select User(s) Sele	ct Partner(s)			
	R	leply by Date	× • All IRFQs	x v			Select Assig	igned B	У					
	2 U	Unassigned 🛛 🛃	DraftRFQ Created	Quote Created	No Bid 🛛 No Bid Subm	nitted Canceled Ir	active Archive	d						
		SEARCH S	VE SET SHAR		No Bid 🛛 No Bid Subm	nitted Canceled Ir	active Archiver	_	Imported REO#	Request ID#	Score	Status	Poss	on Owner
			VE SET SHAR		No Bid ⊡No Bid Subm	Canceled In	active Archives		Imported RFQ#	Request ID#		Status	Reas	on Owner
		SEARCH S	AVE SET SHAR	E DOWNLOAD			active Archive	_	Imported RFQ# 1308282001	Request ID# 51458	Score 1,285.000		Reas	on Owner
	Full	SEARCH S	VE SET SHAR		No Bid No Bid Subm	User						Draft	Reaso	on Owner
	Full Bul Client RFQ.#	SEARCH SU I RFQSearch (Syr Ik Assignment Vehicle	VE SET SHAR tax) Status Select Status Score Status	E DOWNLOAD	Team(s)	User	_		1308282001	51458	1,285.000 985.000	Draft		on Owner
130103001	Full Bul Bul 434700095	SEARCH Su II RFQ Search (Syr Ik Assignment Vehicle SEWP ABC	SET SHAR Status Select Status Score Status 0.000 Draft	E DOWNLOAD	Team(s)	n(s) User	_		1308282001 1308247001 1308078002	51458 51410 51184	1,285.000 985.000 790.000	Draft Draft Bid - Create Quo		on Owner
130103001130107001	Eul Full But 434700095 434700099	SEARCH Su II RFQSearch (Syr Ik Assignment Vehicle SEWP ABC SEWP ABC	SET SHAR Status Select Status Score Status 0.000 Draft 0.000 Draft	E DOWNLOAD	Team(s)	n(s) User	_		1308282001 1308247001	51458 51410	1,285.000 985.000	Draft Draft Bid - Create Quo		Civilian Civilian - Di Civilian - Civilian - Si
 130103001 130107001 130109001 	Eul Bul Client RFQ # 434700099 434700099	SEARCH Su IRFQSearch (Syr Ik Assignment Vehicle SEWP ABC SEWP ABC SEWP ABC	Status Status Select Status Select Status 0000 Draft 0.000 Draft 0.000 Draft 0.000 Draft	E DOWNLOAD	Team(s)	n(s) User	_		1308282001 1308247001 1308078002	51458 51410 51184	1,285.000 985.000 790.000	Draft Draft <mark>Bid - Create Quo</mark> Draft		Civilian Civilian - Si Civilian - Si Dwohn Intel
 130103001 130107001 	Eul Full But 434700095 434700099	SEARCH Su II RFQSearch (Syr Ik Assignment Vehicle SEWP ABC SEWP ABC	SET SHAR Status Select Status Score Status 0.000 Draft 0.000 Draft	E DOWNLOAD	Team(s)	n(s) User	_		1308282001 1308247001 1308078002 1308078001	51458 51410 51184 51184	1,285.000 985.000 790.000 765.000	Draft Draft <mark>Bid - Create Quo</mark> Draft Draft		Civilian Civilian - Di Civilian - SI Dwohit Intel Intel - DIA Military
 130103001 130107001 130109001 130110001 130115001 	Eul Full But 434700095 434700099 434700101 434700102	SEARCH SA II REQ.Search (Syn Ik Assignment Volicia SEWP ABC SEWP ABC SEWP ABC	NE SET SHAR Salut Salut Salut Salect Status Some Status 0.000 Draft 0.000 0.000 Draft 0.000 0.000 Draft 0.000 0.000 Draft 0.000	E DOWNLOAD	Team(s)	n(s) User	_		1308282001 1308247001 1308078002 1308078001 1308118001 1308001001	51458 51410 51184 51184 51233 51083	1,285.000 985.000 790.000 765.000 755.000 740.000	Draft Draft Bid-Create Quo Draft Draft Draft		Civilian - Di Civilian - Di Civilian - Si Dividian - Si Dividian - Si Intel Intel Intel - DIA
 130103001 130107001 130109001 130110001 130115001 130117001 	But Sub Sub Sub Sub Sub Sub Sub Sub	SEARCH SU IIRFQ.Search (Syn Welde SEWP ABC SEWP ABC SEWP ABC SEWP ABC	NE SET SHAR Salect Status Salect Status Socie Status 0.000 Draft	E DOWNLOAD	Team(s)	n(s) User	_		1308282001 1308247001 1308078002 1308078001 1308118001	51458 51410 51184 51184 51233	1,285,000 985,000 790,000 765,000 755,000	Draft Draft Bid-Create Quo Draft Draft Draft	te	Civilian - Di Civilian - Di Civilian - Si Dwoht Intel Intel - DIA Military - Ar
 130107001 130109001 130110001 130115001 	Build Build Cleat 692.81 43470009 434700001 434700102 434700103 434700103 1000001	SEARCH SU IIRFC Search (Syn Weikle SEV/P ABC SEV/P ABC SEV/P ABC SEV/P ABC SEV/P ABC	Status Status Status Status Status Status Score Status 0000 Draft	E DOWNLOAD	Team(s)	n(s) User	_		1308282001 1308247001 1308078002 1308078001 1308118001 1308001001	51458 51410 51184 51184 51233 51083	1,285,000 985,000 790,000 765,000 755,000 740,000	Draft Draft Bid - Create Quo Draft Draft Draft	te .37 PM EDT	Civilian - Di Civilian - Di Civilian - Si Dwoht Intel Intel - DIA Military - Ar
 130103001 130107001 130109001 130110001 130115001 130117001 130123001 	Full Bull # Clast 690 # 434700095 434700102 434700103 1000001 534700096	SEARCH SUP ABC IRPC Search (Syn IRPC Search (Syn IRPC Search (Syn Vekcle SEVP ABC SEVP ABC SEVP ABC SEVP ABC SEVP ABC SEVP ABC SEVP ABC	NE SET SURE Status Status Status Salect Status Status Status 0.000 Draft 0.000 0.000 Draft 0.000	E DOWNLOAD	Team(s)	n(s) User	_		1308282001 1308247001 1308078002 1308078001 1308118001 1308001001	51458 51410 51184 51184 51233 51083	1,285,000 985,000 790,000 755,000 755,000 740,000	Draft Draft Bid - Create Quo Draft Draft Draft Draft	te 37 рм.еот .00 рм.еот	Civilian - Di Civilian - Di Civilian - Si Dwoht Intel Intel - DIA Military - Ar

Copyright 2012-2021 Contrager Corp. All rights reserved. All text, pictures, graphics, sound/video/animation files and their layout are subject to copyright laws and other laws protecting intellectual property. They may not be copied for business purposes or distribution, nor may they be modified and used on other web sites without express permission from Contrager Corp.



Profiles - use market intelligence to shape new business

Identifying existing technology and projects within an agency can be difficult and time consuming. Building an effective vendor / partner strategy and researching past prices can be equally challenging. With Contrager, you can:

- Support proposal development with precise insight into past awards by agency and vendor
- Discover platform and brand preferences in agencies and programs
- Build a list of support services contracts with award and renewal dates
- Identify OEMs and partners selling through the channel and directly, and at what award price
- Find a last-minute partner when you shaped the opportunity, then see unanticipated additional requirements in the RFP or RFQ

Business Development and Outside Sales teams use our data visualization to gain insight and intelligence from government agencies and programs, and contractor companies and contacts to map accounts, position against competitors and win more business.



Teaming - Efficiently build a winning team

Coming in early 2022, use big data analytics to search teaming contact names, titles, emails and numbers. Identify the best-fit partners based on current and historic performance, socioeconomic status, and awards.

Learn more

Info@Contrager.com

www.Contrager.com

(855) 321-0034

Copyright 2012-2021 Contraqer Corp. All rights reserved. All text, pictures, graphics, sound/video/animation files and their layout are subject to copyright laws and other laws protecting intellectual property. They may not be copied for business purposes or distribution, nor may they be modified and used on other web sites without express permission from Contraqer Corp.